
NCCC/West Region Meetings  

September 13-14, 2024 St. Louis, MO 

The 2025 NCCC National Convention will be held in the Wisconsin Dells August 
17-22, 2025.  Current information is available on the NCCC website under the 
Convention tab.  The 2024 NCCC convention, held in Joplin, MO this year reported 
that the convention made approximately $36,000.00.   

The RCDs are working on the following matters: 

   Teardown requirements for C8s as they relate to the record drag program.  The 
RCDs are looking at alternatives to this requirement. 

   Parade laps may become required for all low and high speed autocross events.  If 
approved, this will be included in the 2026 rulebook. 

   Training for course workers and drivers on the use of fire extinguishers may 
become mandatory.  More to come on this. 

   A Safety Committee is being formed to develop guidelines for required training 
for event workers. 

NCCC FCOA program currently has 1,085 members.  That number is down 11% 
from last year.  NCCC membership stands at 18,686 with 235 clubs. 

The NCCC membership database will be shut down October 1-2, 2025.  Following 
the shutdown, it will reopen, and membership renewals will be accepted.  When 
submitting membership renewals, it has been requested the members list their 
newest Corvette owned in the member information.  This will allow NCCC to 
provide potential sponsors with an approximate count of C7 and C8 models 
owned by the membership.  Additional owned Corvettes should be reported in 
the comments section of the membership database.  Club governors and/or 
membership directors are responsible for updating this information.  All 
membership renewal processing MUST be completed by November 15, 2024. 

The West Region officers for 2025 will be as follows: 



   Regional Executive (RE):  Dennis Luther, Corvette Club of Iowa 

   Regional Competition Director (RCD):  Lauren Killum, Cornhusker Corvette Club 

   Regional Membership Director (RMD):  Deb Hird, 4-States Corvette Club 

   Regional Secretary:  Sheila Wyman, Corvette Club of Iowa 

   Regional Treasurer:  Linda Hommer, Corvette Club of Iowa 

The NCCC treasurer did not provide any financial reports at this meeting.  She 
indicated that her computer was not functioning properly.  This condition has 
existed for several months.  She will not be running for NCCC treasurer in the 
upcoming election.   

The NCCC business manager has indicated that the utilization of our insurance 
waiver forms have been critical in settling insurance claims.  Outcomes have been 
very favorable when signed insurance waiver forms have been available. 

CCI’s check for $1,000.00 for St. Jude’s Children’s Hospital was presented to the 
NCCC Director of Sponsorship and Charity. 

Three NCCC awards were presented at this meeting, as they were not able to be 
presented at the Joplin Convention.  The awards were: 

   Past President’s Award:  David and Linda Goebel 

   Don Hoskins Award:  Joan Heineman 

   President’s Award:  Chris Reitz 

NCCC National Governors’ meetings will continue to be held in St. Louis through 
2028.  As a result, the West Region meetings will also continue to be held in 
conjunction with the NCCC Governors’ meetings through 2028. 

Jay Hommer 

Governor, CCI 

                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                      




